

**Small Extended Cab, 4x2, 6ft Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Frontier, Colorado, Canyon, etc.)**

Vehicle Minimum Specifications	Estimated Qty: 4	Pkg Code, NA, or STD
Line 1 - Air conditioning		STD ✓
Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column		STD ✓
Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control		PCN ✓
Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers		STD ✓
Line 5 - Rear Step bumper		STD ✓
Line 6 - Engine: Provide base engine. If base engine is available as E85 Flex-Fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.6</u> HP <u>308</u> Torque <u>275</u> . E-85: <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No		LGZ ✓
Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes		STD ✓
Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat with folding center armrest or front bucket seats, cloth upholstery, and rear seat(s)		H2R ✓
Line 9 - Rubber/vinyl floor covering, if not available carpet with OEM floor mats must be provided.		B38 ✓
Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial		STD ✓
Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Compact		STD ✓
Line 12 - Power windows		STD ✓
Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry		PCN ✓
Line 14 - Bluetooth: OEM installation required if available. Dealer installation acceptable if not available from OEM		STD ✓
Line 15 - Four (4) complete key sets with fobs		5H1/DIV ✓
Line 16 - Stability Control System		STD ✓
Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors		PCX ✓
Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights		STD ✓
Line 19 - Limited Slip or Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.42</u> .		G80 ✓
Line 20 - Trailer tow package: OEM Required		Z82 ✓
Line 21 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable		JL1 ✓
*If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right:		
Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location:		\$23,541.00 ✓
Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision:		\$1.75
Vendor Name:	KARL CHEVROLET Inc	
Vehicle Make:	Chevrolet ✓	
Vehicle Model Name:	Colorado ✓	
Exact Model Code:	12M53 ✓	
Trim pkg. Common Name:	WT ✓	
Engine Code:	LGZ ✓	
Transmission Code:	M5T ✓	
GVWR:	5700	
Payload Capacity:	1100 ✓	
Wheelbase:	128	

Small Extended Cab, 4x2, 6ft Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Frontier, Colorado, Canyon, etc.)

Vehicle Minimum Specifications	Estimated Qty: 42	Pkg Code, NA, or STD
Line 1 - Air conditioning		STD ✓
Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column		STD ✓
Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control		PCN ✓
Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers		STD ✓
Line 5 - Rear Step bumper		STD ✓
Line 6 - Engine: Provide base engine. If base engine is available as E85 Flex-Fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>4</u> Liters <u>2.5</u> HP <u>200</u> Torque <u>191</u> . E-85: <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No		LCV ✓
Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes		STD ✓
Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat with folding center armrest or front bucket seats, cloth upholstery, and rear seat(s)		H2R ✓
Line 9 - Rubber/vinyl floor covering, if not available carpet with OEM floor mats must be provided.		B38 ✓
Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial		STD ✓
Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Compact		STD ✓
Line 12 - Power windows		STD ✓
Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry		PCN ✓
Line 14 - Bluetooth: OEM installation required if available. Dealer installation acceptable if not available from OEM		STD ✓
Line 15 - Two (2) complete key sets with fobs		STD ✓
Line 16 - Stability Control System		STD ✓
Line 17 - Manual or Power Exterior Mirrors Acceptable		STD ✓
Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights		STD ✓
Line 19 - Limited Slip or Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio. <u>4.10</u> .		G80 ✓
Line 20 - DOT Orange Paint		9W4 ✓
*If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right:		
Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location:		\$21,633.00 ✓
Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision:		\$1.75
Vendor Name:	KARL CHEVROLET Inc	
Vehicle Make:	Chevrolet	
Vehicle Model Name:	Colorado	
Exact Model Code:	12M53 ✓	
Trim pkg. Common Name:	WT ✓	
Engine Code:	LCV ✓	
Transmission Code:	MYB ✓	
GVWR:	5400 ✓	
Payload Capacity:	1100 ✓	
Wheelbase:	128 ✓	

**Small Extended Cab, 4x4, 6ft Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Frontier, Colorado, Canyon, etc.)**

Vehicle Minimum Specifications	Estimated Qty: 2	Pkg Code, NA, or STD
Line 1 - Air conditioning		STD ✓
Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column		STD ✓
Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control		PCN ✓
Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers		STD ✓
Line 5 - Rear Step bumper		STD ✓
Line 6 - Engine: Provide base engine. If base engine is available as E85 Flex-Fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders 4 Liters 2.5 HP 200 Torque 191 . E-85: <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No		LCV ✓
Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes		STD ✓
Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat with folding center armrest or front bucket seats, cloth upholstery, and rear seat(s)		H2R ✓
Line 9 - Rubber/vinyl floor covering, if not available carpet with OEM floor mats must be provided.		B38 ✓
Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial		STD ✓
Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Compact		STD ✓
Line 12 - Power windows		STD ✓
Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry		PCN ✓
Line 14 - Bluetooth: OEM installation required if available. Dealer installation acceptable if not available from OEM		STD ✓
Line 15 - Four (4) complete key sets with fobs		5H1/DI ✓
Line 16 - Stability Control System		STD ✓
Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors		PCX ✓
Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights		STD ✓
Line 19 - Limited Slip or Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>4.10</u> .		G80 ✓
Line 20 - Electronic Shift-on-the-Fly Transfer Case		STD ✓
*If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right:		
Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location:		\$24,649.00 ✓
Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision:		\$1.75
Vendor Name:		KARL CHEVROLET Inc
Vehicle Make:		Chevrolet ✓
Vehicle Model Name:		Colorado ✓
Exact Model Code:		12M53 ✓
Trim pkg. Common Name:		WT ✓
Engine Code:		LCV ✓
Transmission Code:		MYB ✓
GVWR:		5400
Payload Capacity:		1100
Wheelbase:		128 ✓

**Small Crew Cab, 4x4, 5ft min. Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Frontier, Colorado, Canyon, etc.)**

Vehicle Minimum Specifications	Estimated Qty: 1	Pkg Code, NA, or STD
Line 1 - Air conditioning		STD ✓
Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column		STD ✓
Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control		PCN ✓
Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers		STD ✓
Line 5 - Rear Step bumper		STD ✓
Line 6 - Engine: Provide base engine. If base engine is available as E85 Flex-Fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders 6 Liters 3.6 HP308 Torque 275 . E-85: <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No		LGZ ✓
Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes		STD ✓
Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat with folding center armrest or front bucket seats, cloth upholstery, and rear seat(s)		H2R ✓
Line 9 - Rubber/vinyl floor covering, if not available carpet with OEM floor mats must be provided.		B38 ✓
Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial		STD ✓
Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Compact		STD ✓
Line 12 - Power windows		STD ✓
Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry		PCN ✓
Line 14 - Bluetooth: OEM installation required if available. Dealer installation acceptable if not available from OEM		STD ✓
Line 15 - Four (4) complete key sets with fobs		5H1/DI ✓
Line 16 - Stability Control System		STD ✓
Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors		PCX ✓
Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights		STD ✓
Line 19 - Limited Slip or Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.42</u> .		G80 ✓
Line 20 - Electronic Shift-on-the-Fly Transfer Case		STD ✓
*If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right:		
Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location:		\$26,946.00
Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision:		\$1.75
Vendor Name:		KARL CHEVROLET Inc
Vehicle Make:		Chevrolet ✓
Vehicle Model Name:		Colorado ✓
Exact Model Code:		12M43 ✓
Trim pkg. Common Name:		WT ✓
Engine Code:		LGZ ✓
Transmission Code:		M5T ✓
GVWR:		6000 ✓
Payload Capacity:		1100 ✓
Wheelbase:		128 ✓

✓
 Regular Cab, 4x2, Long Box, Automatic Transmission
 (i.e. Silverado 1500, F150, Ram 1500, etc.)

Vehicle Minimum Specifications	Estimated Qty: 1	Pkg Code, NA, or STD
Line 1 - Air conditioning		STD ✓
Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column		STD ✓
Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control		STD ✓
Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers		STD ✓
Line 5 - Rear Step bumper		STD ✓
Line 6 - Engine: Provide base engine. If base engine is available as E85 Flex-Fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.6</u> HP <u>305</u> Torque <u>269</u> . E-85: <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No		ERB ✓
Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes		STD ✓
Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest		V9X8 ✓
Line 9 - Rubber/vinyl floor covering, if not available carpet with OEM floor mats must be provided.		STD ✓
Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial		STD ✓
Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact		STD ✓
Line 12 - Power windows		AJH ✓
Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry		AJH ✓
Line 14 - Bluetooth: OEM installation required if available. Dealer installation acceptable if not available from OEM		UA1 ✓
Line 15 - Four (4) complete key sets with fobs		DEALER ✓
Line 16 - Stability Control System		STD ✓
Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors, heated		AJH ✓
Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights		LM1 ✓
Line 19 - Limited Slip or Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.21</u> .		DSA ✓
Line 20 - Trailer tow package: OEM Required		STD ✓
Line 21 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable		XHC ✓
*If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right:		
Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location:		\$19,821.44 ✓
Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision:		\$1.25
Vendor Name:		STEW HANSEN DODGE CITY
Vehicle Make:		RAM ✓
Vehicle Model Name:		1500 ✓
Exact Model Code:		DS1L62 ✓
Trim pkg. Common Name:		TRADESMAN ✓
Engine Code:		ERB ✓
Transmission Code:		DFL ✓
GVWR:		6600
Payload Capacity:		1870
Wheelbase:		140"

✓ ✓ ✓
Regular Cab, 4x2, Long Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Silverado 1500, F150, Ram 1500, etc.)

Vehicle Minimum Specifications	Estimated Qty: 11	Pkg Code, NA, or STD
Line 1 - Air conditioning		STD ✓
Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column		STD ✓
Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control		STD ✓
Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers		STD ✓
Line 5 - Rear Step bumper		STD ✓
Line 6 - Engine: Provide base engine. If base engine is available as E85 Flex-Fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.6</u> HP <u>305</u> Torque <u>269</u> . E-85: <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No		ERB ✓
Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes		STD ✓
Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest		V9X8 ✓
Line 9 - Rubber/vinyl floor covering, if not available carpet with OEM floor mats must be provided.		STD ✓
Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial		STD ✓
Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact		STD ✓
Line 12 - Power windows		AJH ✓
Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry		AJH ✓
Line 14 - Bluetooth: OEM installation required if available. Dealer installation acceptable if not available from OEM		UA1 ✓
Line 15 - Two (2) complete key sets with fobs		DEALER ✓
Line 16 - Stability Control System		STD ✓
Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors, heated		AJH ✓
Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights		LM1 ✓
Line 19 - Limited Slip or Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.21</u> .		DSA ✓
Line 20 - DOT Orange Paint		P62 ✓
*If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right:		
Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location:		\$19,872.44 ✓
Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision:		\$1.25
Vendor Name:		STEW HANSEN DODGE CITY
Vehicle Make:		RAM ✓
Vehicle Model Name:		1500 ✓
Exact Model Code:		DS1L62 ✓
Trim pkg. Common Name:		TRADESMAN ✓
Engine Code:		ERB ✓
Transmission Code:		DFL ✓
GVWR:		6600
Payload Capacity:		1870
Wheelbase:		140"

**Regular Cab, 4x2, Long Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Silverado 1500, F150, Ram 1500, etc.)**

Vehicle Minimum Specifications	Estimated Qty: 11	Pkg Code, NA, or STD
Line 1 - Air conditioning		STD ✓
Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column		STD ✓
Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control		STD ✓
Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers		STD ✓
Line 5 - Rear Step bumper		STD ✓
Line 6 - Engine: Provide base engine. If base engine is available as E85 Flex-Fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.6</u> HP <u>305</u> Torque <u>269</u> . E-85: <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No		ERB ✓
Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes		STD ✓
Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest		V9X8 ✓
Line 9 - Rubber/vinyl floor covering, if not available carpet with OEM floor mats must be provided.		STD ✓
Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial		STD ✓
Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact		STD ✓
Line 12 - Power windows		AJH ✓
Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry		AJH ✓
Line 14 - Bluetooth: OEM installation required if available. Dealer installation acceptable if not available from OEM		UA1 ✓
Line 15 - Two (2) complete key sets with fobs		DEALER ✓
Line 16 - Stability Control System		STD ✓
Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors, heated		AJH ✓
Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights		LM1 ✓
Line 19 - Limited Slip or Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.21</u> .		DSA ✓
Line 20 - Trailer tow package: OEM Required		STD ✓
Line 21 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable		XHC ✓
Line 22 - DOT Orange Paint		P62 ✓
*If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right:		
Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location:		\$20,226.38 ✓
Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision:		\$1.25
Vendor Name:		STEW HANSEN DODGE CITY
Vehicle Make:		RAM ✓
Vehicle Model Name:		1500 ✓
Exact Model Code:		DS1L62 ✓
Trim pkg. Common Name:		TRADESMAN ✓
Engine Code:		ERB ✓
Transmission Code:		DFL ✓
GVWR:		6600
Payload Capacity:		1870
Wheelbase:		140"

Extended Cab, 4x2, Short Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Silverado 1500, F150, Ram 1500, etc.)

Vehicle Minimum Specifications	Estimated Qty: 2	Pkg Code, NA, or STD
Line 1 - Air conditioning		STD ✓
Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column		STD ✓
Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control		STD ✓
Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers		STD ✓
Line 5 - Rear Step bumper		STD ✓
Line 6 - Engine: Provide base engine. If base engine is available as E85 Flex-Fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.6</u> HP <u>305</u> Torque <u>269</u> . E-85: <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No		ERB ✓
Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes		STD ✓
Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest, and rear seat(s)		V9X8 ✓
Line 9 - Rubber/vinyl floor covering, if not available carpet with OEM floor mats must be provided.		STD ✓
Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial		STD ✓
Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact		STD ✓
Line 12 - Power windows		STD ✓
Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry		GXM ✓
Line 14 - Bluetooth: OEM installation required if available. Dealer installation acceptable if not available from OEM		UA1 ✓
Line 15 - Four (4) complete key sets with fobs		DEALER ✓
Line 16 - Stability Control System		STD ✓
Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors, heated		STD ✓
Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights		LM1 ✓
Line 19 - Limited Slip or Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.21</u> .		DSA ✓
Line 20 - Trailer tow package: OEM Required		STD ✓
Line 21 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable		XHC ✓
*If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right:		
Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location:		\$20,102.86 ✓
Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision:		\$1.25
Vendor Name:		STEW HANSEN DODGE CITY
Vehicle Make:		RAM ✓
Vehicle Model Name:		1500 ✓
Exact Model Code:		DS1L41 ✓
Trim pkg. Common Name:		TRADESMAN ✓
Engine Code:		ERB ✓
Transmission Code:		DFL ✓
GVWR:		6800
Payload Capacity:		1880
Wheelbase:		140"

**Extended Cab, 4x4, Short Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Silverado 1500, F150, Ram 1500, etc.)**

Vehicle Minimum Specifications	Estimated Qty: 1	Pkg Code, NA, or STD
Line 1 - Air conditioning		STD ✓
Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column		STD ✓
Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control		STD ✓
Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers		STD ✓
Line 5 - Rear Step bumper		STD ✓
Line 6 - Engine: Provide base engine. If base engine is available as E85 Flex-Fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.6</u> HP <u>305</u> Torque <u>269</u> . E-85: <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No		ERB ✓
Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes		STD ✓
Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest, and rear seat(s)		V9X8 ✓
Line 9 - Rubber/vinyl floor covering, if not available carpet with OEM floor mats must be provided.		STD ✓
Line 10 - Tires, all-terrain radial (all-season NOT acceptable)		TTB ✓
Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact		STD ✓
Line 12 - Power windows		STD ✓
Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry		GXM ✓
Line 14 - Bluetooth: OEM installation required if available. Dealer installation acceptable if not available from OEM		UA1 ✓
Line 15 - Four (4) complete key sets with fobs		DEALER ✓
Line 16 - Stability Control System		STD ✓
Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors, heated		STD ✓
Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights		LM1 ✓
Line 19 - Limited Slip or Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.21</u> .		DSA ✓
Line 20 - Electronic Shift-on-the-Fly Transfer Case		STD ✓
Line 21 - Trailer tow package: OEM Required		STD ✓
Line 22 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable		XHC ✓
*If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right:		
Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location:		\$22,522.92 ✓
Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision:		\$1.25 ✓
Vendor Name:		STEW HANSEN DODGE CITY ✓
Vehicle Make:		RAM ✓
Vehicle Model Name:		1500 ✓
Exact Model Code:		DS6L41 ✓
Trim pkg. Common Name:		TRADESMAN ✓
Engine Code:		ERB ✓
Transmission Code:		DFL ✓
GVWR:		6800 ✓
Payload Capacity:		1700 ✓
Wheelbase:		140" ✓

✓
✓
✓
Extended Cab, 4x4, Short Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Silverado 1500, F150, Ram 1500, etc.)

Vehicle Minimum Specifications	Estimated Qty: 8	Pkg Code, NA, or STD
Line 1 - Air conditioning		STD ✓
Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column		STD ✓
Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control		STD ✓
Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers		STD ✓
Line 5 - Rear Step bumper		STD ✓
Line 6 - Engine: Provide base engine. If base engine is available as E85 Flex-Fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.6</u> HP <u>305</u> Torque <u>269</u> . E-85: <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No		ERB ✓
Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes		STD ✓
Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest, and rear seat(s)		V9X8 ✓
Line 9 - Rubber/vinyl floor covering, if not available carpet with OEM floor mats must be provided.		STD ✓
Line 10 - Tires, all-terrain radial (all-season NOT acceptable)		TTB ✓
Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact		STD ✓
Line 12 - Power windows		STD ✓
Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry		GXM ✓
Line 14 - Bluetooth: OEM installation required if available. Dealer installation acceptable if not available from OEM		UA1 ✓
Line 15 - Two (2) complete key sets with fobs		DEALER ✓
Line 16 - Stability Control System		STD ✓
Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors, heated		STD ✓
Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights		LM1 ✓
Line 19 - Limited Slip or Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.21</u> .		DSA ✓
Line 20 - Electronic Shift-on-the-Fly Transfer Case		STD ✓
Line 21 - DOT Orange Paint		P62 ✓
*If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right:		
Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location:		\$22,572.90 ✓
Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision:		\$1.25
Vendor Name:		STEW HANSEN DODGE CITY
Vehicle Make:		RAM ✓
Vehicle Model Name:		1500 ✓
Exact Model Code:		DS6L41 ✓
Trim pkg. Common Name:		TRADESMAN ✓
Engine Code:		ERB ✓
Transmission Code:		DFL ✓
GVWR:		6800
Payload Capacity:		1700
Wheelbase:		140"

Extended Cab, 4x4, Short Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Silverado 1500, F150, Ram 1500, etc.)

Vehicle Minimum Specifications	Estimated Qty: 2	Pkg Code, NA, or STD
Line 1 - Air conditioning		STD ✓
Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column		STD ✓
Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control		STD ✓
Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers		STD ✓
Line 5 - Rear Step bumper		STD ✓
Line 6 - Engine: Provide base engine. If base engine is available as E85 Flex-Fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.6</u> HP <u>305</u> Torque <u>269</u> . E-85: <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No		ERB ✓
Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes		STD ✓
Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest, and rear seat(s)		V9X8 ✓
Line 9 - Rubber/vinyl floor covering, if not available carpet with OEM floor mats must be provided.		STD ✓
Line 10 - Tires, all-terrain radial (all-season NOT acceptable)		TTB ✓
Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact		STD ✓
Line 12 - Power windows		STD ✓
Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry		GXM ✓
Line 14 - Bluetooth: OEM installation required if available. Dealer installation acceptable if not available from OEM		UA1 ✓
Line 15 - Two (2) complete key sets with fobs		DEALER ✓
Line 16 - Stability Control System		STD ✓
Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors, heated		STD ✓
Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights		LM1 ✓
Line 19 - Limited Slip or Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.21</u> .		DSA ✓
Line 20 - Electronic Shift-on-the-Fly Transfer Case		STD ✓
Line 21 - Trailer tow package: OEM Required		STD ✓
Line 22 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable		XHC ✓
Line 23 - DOT Orange Paint		P62 ✓
*If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right:		
Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location:		\$22,926.84 ✓
Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision:		\$1.25
Vendor Name:	STEW HANSEN DODGE CITY	
Vehicle Make:	RAM ✓	
Vehicle Model Name:	1500 ✓	
Exact Model Code:	DS6L41 ✓	
Trim pkg. Common Name:	TRADESMAN ✓	
Engine Code:	ERB ✓	
Transmission Code:	DFL ✓	
GVWR:	6800	
Payload Capacity:	1700	
Wheelbase:	140"	

Crew Cab, 4x2, Short Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Silverado 1500, F150, Ram 1500, etc.)

Vehicle Minimum Specifications	Estimated Qty: 1	Pkg Code, NA, or STD
Line 1 - Air conditioning		STD ✓
Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column		STD ✓
Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control		STD ✓
Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers		STD ✓
Line 5 - Rear Step bumper		STD ✓
Line 6 - Engine: Provide base engine. If base engine is available as E85 Flex-Fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.6</u> HP <u>305</u> Torque <u>269</u> . E-85: <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No		ERB ✓
Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes		STD ✓
Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest		V9X8 ✓
Line 9 - Rubber/vinyl floor covering, if not available carpet with OEM floor mats must be provided.		STD ✓
Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial		STD ✓
Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact		STD ✓
Line 12 - Power windows		STD ✓
Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry		GXM ✓
Line 14 - Bluetooth: OEM installation required if available. Dealer installation acceptable if not available from OEM		UA1 ✓
Line 15 - Four (4) complete key sets with fobs		DEALER ✓
Line 16 - Stability Control System		STD ✓
Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors, heated		STD ✓
Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights		LM1 ✓
Line 19 - Limited Slip or Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.21</u> .		DSA ✓
Line 20 - Trailer tow package: OEM Required		STD ✓
Line 21 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable		XHC ✓
*If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right:		
Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location:		\$21,142.86 ✓
Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision:		\$1.25
Vendor Name:		STEW HANSEN DODGE CITY
Vehicle Make:		RAM ✓
Vehicle Model Name:		1500 ✓
Exact Model Code:		DS1L98 ✓
Trim pkg. Common Name:		TRADESMAN
Engine Code:		ERB ✓
Transmission Code:		DFL ✓
GVWR:		6800
Payload Capacity:		1820
Wheelbase:		140" ✓

Crew Cab, 4x4, Short Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Silverado 1500, F150, Ram 1500, etc.)

Vehicle Minimum Specifications	Estimated Qty: 2	Pkg Code, NA, or STD
Line 1 - Air conditioning		STD ✓
Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column		STD ✓
Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control		STD ✓
Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers		STD ✓
Line 5 - Rear Step bumper		STD ✓
Line 6 - Engine: Provide base engine. If base engine is available as E85 Flex-Fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.6</u> HP <u>305</u> Torque <u>269</u> . E-85: <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No		ERB ✓
Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes		STD ✓
Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest		V9X8 ✓
Line 9 - Rubber/vinyl floor covering, if not available carpet with OEM floor mats must be provided.		STD ✓
Line 10 - Tires, all-terrain radial (all-season NOT acceptable)		TTB ✓
Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact		STD ✓
Line 12 - Power windows		STD ✓
Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry		GXM ✓
Line 14 - Bluetooth: OEM installation required if available. Dealer installation acceptable if not available from OEM		UA1 ✓
Line 15 - Four (4) complete key sets with fobs		DEALER ✓
Line 16 - Stability Control System		STD ✓
Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors, heated		STD ✓
Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights		LM1 ✓
Line 19 - Limited Slip or Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.21</u> .		DSA ✓
Line 20 - Electronic Shift-on-the-Fly Transfer Case		STD ✓
Line 21 - Trailer tow package: OEM Required		STD ✓
Line 22 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable		XHC ✓
*If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right:		
Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location:		\$23,741.42 ✓
Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision:		\$1.25
Vendor Name:	STEW HANSEN DODGE CITY	
Vehicle Make:	RAM ✓	
Vehicle Model Name:	1500 ✓	
Exact Model Code:	DS6L98 ✓	
Trim pkg. Common Name:	TRADESMAN ✓	
Engine Code:	ERB ✓	
Transmission Code:	DFL ✓	
GVWR:	6800	
Payload Capacity:	1630	
Wheelbase:	140"	